
   

 

 Year 5 – Summer 2 

These activities are designed to give you ideas of activities to do at home with your families or independently, to 

support your learning at school. Please choose three to complete this half term. We can’t wait to see your creativity! 

Science 
 

 What do you know about life cycles?  
  
Visit How do humans change during 
their lifetime? - BBC Bitesize  
…To learn about how humans change 
during their lifetime…  
Remember to record down your 
research to show the class! 
 

English 
 

Pick an author from a book you have 
read this year and create a biography.  
You should try to include: 

• Conjunctions, adverbs and 
prepositions to make the 
order of events clear 

• Facts about the person’s life 

• past tense vocabulary 

• third person pronouns 
 

Maths 
 

Can you make different 3D shapes? 
Use lolly sticks, toothpicks or 
matchsticks to make these 3D objects. 
If you have some playdough or sticky 
tack, you can use it to stick your 
corners together. How many faces, 
edges and vertices can you see on 
each object? 

Art 
 

European Artists 
 
We are studying famous European 
Artists this half term. 
 
Look at the art of Leonardo Da Vinci. 
 
What do you like about it? What do 
you think inspired him? 
 
See if you can recreate one of his 
famous drawings using pencil! 
 

Geography 
 
‘South America - why does the amazon 

matter?’ 
 
This half term, our Geography Topic is 
‘South America - why does the amazon 
matter?’ 
 
Can you locate the rainforests on a 
globe, a map or online? Learn about 
the different layers of the rainforest. 
Make an information leaflet about 
what lives in each level and area. 

TTRS 
 

Please ensure that you are practising 
TTRS at home.  
This will support our in-class learning.  

 

Rounders 
 

Prepare yourself for our upcoming 
ROUNDERS lessons… 

 
This half term, Year 5 are learning to play 

ROUNDERS. 
Learn the basics at: 

 
How to Play Rounders - YouTube 
 

PSHCE 
 

In PSHCE this half term, we will be 
looking at “Growing and Changing in 

Humans”. 
As part of this, we will be looking at 

how we emotionally change as well as 
physically. 

Visit: 
Mental Health Support For Young 

People | YoungMinds 
 

This website will give some great tips 
for supporting these changes. 

https://www.bbc.co.uk/bitesize/topics/zxfrwmn/articles/zk4bgwx
https://www.bbc.co.uk/bitesize/topics/zxfrwmn/articles/zk4bgwx
https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=pmCMS46_N-U
https://www.youngminds.org.uk/young-person/
https://www.youngminds.org.uk/young-person/

